
How An Improbable Bid For The 1932
Olympics Transformed Los Angeles From
Dusty

Los Angeles, known today as the entertainment capital of the world, with its
vibrant lifestyle and iconic landmarks, was once just a dusty city trying to emerge
from its Western roots. But all that changed with an improbable bid to host the
1932 Olympics, which transformed the city forever and set it on the path to
become one of the most influential cities in the world.

The Beginnings of the Bid

In the 1920s, Los Angeles was still a relatively small city with limited infrastructure
and a struggling economy. However, a group of visionary civic leaders saw the
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potential of hosting the Olympics as a way to put their city on the map.
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Against all odds, they started preparing a bid to bring the international event to
Los Angeles. The bid was considered highly improbable due to the city's limited
resources and the competition it faced from more established cities like
Barcelona, Rome, and Amsterdam.

The Unexpected Victory

To everyone's surprise, Los Angeles won the bid to host the 1932 Olympics. This
unexpected victory led to a surge of excitement and optimism in the city. It was an
opportunity for Los Angeles to showcase its potential on a global stage and prove
its ability to overcome challenges.

The news of the winning bid ignited a series of transformations across the city. A
massive infrastructure campaign began, with new stadiums, sports arenas, and
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Olympic villages constructed to accommodate the thousands of athletes and
spectators expected to visit. The dusty city began to transform into a modern
metropolis.

The Olympic Effect

The hosting of the Olympics not only brought economic benefits but also
triggered a cultural transformation within Los Angeles. The city eagerly embraced
the international event and its participants, building bridges between different
cultures and fostering a sense of global unity.

The Olympic games became a symbol of hope and progress for the people of Los
Angeles. It brought people together, regardless of their backgrounds, to celebrate
the universal values of sportsmanship, competition, and friendship. This sense of
unity and positivity left a lasting impact on the city's identity.

Legacy and Beyond

The success of the 1932 Olympics laid the foundation for future sporting events in
Los Angeles, including the iconic 1984 Olympics. It also attracted a wave of
tourism, investment, and migration to the city, fueling its growth and making it an
attractive destination for people from all walks of life.

Today, Los Angeles is a bustling metropolis that thrives on its reputation as a
global center for entertainment, innovation, and culture. The improbable bid for
the 1932 Olympics played a crucial role in transforming Los Angeles from a dusty
city to a glamorous symbol of progress and dreams.

The story of how an improbable bid for the 1932 Olympics transformed Los
Angeles from a dusty city into an international powerhouse is a testament to the
power of vision, determination, and resilience. The Olympic games not only



brought economic prosperity but also united people and reshaped the city's
identity.

Los Angeles continues to host major international events, leaving a lasting legacy
from its humble beginnings. It proves that with the right opportunity and a
community driven by a common purpose, even the most improbable dreams can
become a reality.
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How one man brought the Olympics to Los Angeles, fueling the city's urban
transformation. 

Dreamers and Schemers chronicles how Los Angeles’s pursuit and staging of the
1932 Olympic Games during the depths of the Great Depression helped fuel the
city’s transformation from a seedy frontier village to a world-famous metropolis.
Leading that pursuit was the “Prince of Realtors,” William May (Billy) Garland, a
prominent figure in early Los Angeles. In important respects, the story of Billy
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Garland is the story of Los Angeles. After arriving in Southern California in 1890,
he and his allies drove much of the city’s historic expansion in the first two
decades of the twentieth century. Then, from 1920 to 1932, he directed the city’s
bid for the 1932 Olympic Games. Garland’s quest to host the Olympics provides
an unusually revealing window onto a particular time, place, and way of life.
Reconstructing the narrative from Garland’s visionary notion to its consequential
aftermath, Barry Siegel shows how one man’s grit and imagination made
California history.
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